
Access to this website may involve the use of cookies. Cookies are small pieces of 
information stored in the browser used by each user on various devices they use to browse 
the internet. These cookies allow the server to remember certain information, which will 
only be read by the server that created it. Cookies enhance the browsing experience, 
making it more user-friendly without causing any harm to the device used. 

Cookies are automatic methods for collecting information about the preferences 
determined by the user during their visit to the website. This enables the website to 
recognize the user, personalize their experience, and facilitate easier navigation. 
Additionally, cookies may help identify and resolve any errors encountered. 

The information collected through cookies may include the date and time of visits, pages 
viewed, time spent on the site, and the websites visited immediately before and after. 
However, no cookie can access the user’s phone number or any other personal contact 
information. Cookies cannot extract information from the user’s hard drive or steal 
personal data. The only way a user’s private information can become part of the cookie file 
is if the user voluntarily provides that information to the server. 

Cookies that can identify an individual are considered personal data, which means that 
the Privacy Policy mentioned above applies to them. User consent is required for their use. 
This consent will be communicated based on an authentic choice, provided through a 
clear and affirmative action before the initial, removable, and documented processing. 

First-Party Cookies 

These are cookies sent to the user’s computer or device and managed exclusively by Club 
Rentals Mallorca to ensure optimal website functionality. The information collected is 
used to enhance the quality of the website and its content, as well as to improve the user’s 
experience. These cookies help recognize the user as a returning visitor, allowing for 
content to be tailored to their preferences. 

Third-Party Cookies 

These cookies are used and managed by external entities that provide services to Club 
Rentals Mallorca to enhance the website and user experience. The primary purposes of 
third-party cookies include gathering access statistics and analyzing browsing 
information, specifically how users interact with the website. 

The data collected includes information such as the number of pages visited, language 
preferences, the location of the user’s IP address, the number of users accessing the site, 
visit frequency and duration, browser type, and device used for access. This information is 
utilized to improve the website and identify new user needs to deliver high-quality content 
and services. Importantly, this data is collected anonymously, and reports on website 
trends are generated without identifying individual users. 

For more information about cookies, privacy, or details on the types of cookies used, 
including their main characteristics and expiration periods, please visit the following 
link(s): Google Analytics 

The entities responsible for providing cookies may transfer this information to third parties 
if required by law or if a third party processes this information on behalf of those entities. 

Disabling, Rejecting, and Deleting Cookies 

https://developers.google.com/analytics/


Users have the option to disable, reject, and delete cookies—either in part or entirely—
installed on their devices by adjusting their browser settings (e.g., Chrome, Firefox, Safari, 
Explorer). The procedures for rejecting and deleting cookies may vary depending on the 
internet browser being used. Therefore, users should follow the instructions provided by 
their respective browsers. If users choose to reject cookies—either fully or partially—they 
may still use the website, although some features may be limited. 

 


